




PAGE NUMBER: 2 

JANUARY 31, 2022 

INVOICE NO. 2020070

KENNETT TOWNSHIP

FILE NUMBER: 157103-00602

DATE TIMEKEEPERDESCRIPTION HOURS AMOUNT

12/10/21 J POLUKA  4.20 2,625.00AT TOWNSHIP BUILDING, WITH  

 

REGARDING  

; DISCUSSION 

 

12/10/21 L BEASER  5.40 3,375.00ANALYZE  

; 

DETAILED REVIEW ; 

ANALYZE  

 

; DISCUSSION WITH J. 

POLUKA;  

; MEET WITH CLIENT 

AT TOWNSHIP BUILDING TO DISCUSS  

; ATTEND  

; RETURN TO 

PHILADELPHIA 

12/11/21 J POLUKA  0.20 125.00REVIEW  CORRESPONDENCE WITH 

 

12/13/21 J POLUKA  0.20 125.00EMAILS WITH E. RATLIFF AND L. BEASER 

REGARDING  

12/15/21 J POLUKA  0.20 125.00EMAILS WITH R. LEFF AND L. BEASER, REGARDING 

 

 

12/16/21 J POLUKA  2.30 1,437.50REVIEW  

 DISCUSSION WITH L.

BEASER REGARDING , 

; CONFERENCE WITH

;

12/16/21 L BEASER  2.30 1,437.50REVIEW  

 

; REVIEW LETTER  

; ANALYZE 

 

T; CONFERENCE WITH R. 

LEFF AND J. POLUKA REGARDING  
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INVOICE NO. 2020070

KENNETT TOWNSHIP

FILE NUMBER: 157103-00602

DATE TIMEKEEPERDESCRIPTION HOURS AMOUNT

12/20/21 L BEASER  2.80 1,750.00REVIEW  

 

T; REVIEW  

 

 

 PREPARE COMMUNICATION TO J. 

POLUKA; REVIEW ANALYZE ; 

DISCUSSION WITH R. LEFF AND POLUKA; REVIEW 

; LEGAL RESEARCH AND 

REVIEW ISSUES REGARDING  

 

COMMUNICATIONS WITH  

 FOLLOW UP WITH 

POLUKA;  

 

12/21/21 J POLUKA  2.20 1,375.00DISCUSSION WITH L. BEASER REGARDING 

; 

CONFERENCE WITH E. RATLIFF AND BEASER 

REGARDING  

; 

CONFERENCE WITH R. LEFF AND BEASER 

REGARDING

; 

RELATED EMAILS TO ALL OF THE ABOVE 

12/21/21 L BEASER  2.90 1,812.50REVIEW AND ANALYZE COMMUNICATIONS, AND 

DOCUMENTS, INCLUDING  

 

 TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH J. 

POLUKA; REVIEW; DISCUSSIONS  

; CONTINUE REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS 

; 

DISCUSSION WITH R. LEFF AND POLUKA; REVIEW 

 

 REVIEW AND ANALYZE 

 

 

 

 TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH 

POLUKA; DISCUSSIONS WITH E. RATLIFF AND 

POLUKA;  

; 

DISCUSSION ; REVIEW 
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KENNETT TOWNSHIP

FILE NUMBER: 157103-00602

DATE TIMEKEEPERDESCRIPTION HOURS AMOUNT

12/22/21 L BEASER  0.30 187.50REVIEW COMMUNICATION FROM E. RATLIFF 

REGARDING  

 

 COMMUNICATION WITH J. 

POLUKA REGARDING SAME;  

12/23/21 J POLUKA  1.80 1,125.00CONFERENCE WITH R. LEFF, AND EMAILS WITH 

BOS, ET AL.; CONFERENCE WITH E. RATLIFF, AND 

EMAILS, REGARDING  

12/27/21 J POLUKA  0.40 250.00REVIEW AND DISCUSS WITH L. BEASER, AND 

EMAILS REGARDING,  

12/27/21 L BEASER  0.70 437.50REVIEW COMMUNICATION FROM R. LEFF WITH 

; COMMUNICATION WITH 

R. LEFF AND THEN J. POLUKA REGARDING SAME; 

PREPARE COMMENTS AND CHANGES  

; REVIEW WITH  J. POLUKA; REVISE SAME; 

FINALIZE AND SEND TO R. LEFF, ET AL.;  

 

12/28/21 J POLUKA  1.90 1,187.50CONFERENCE WITH R. LEFF AND L. BEASER, 

DISCUSSION WITH BEASER, AND EMAILS, 

REGARDING ; CONFERENCES 

WITH  

 DISCUSSION WITH BEASER, AND EMAILS, 

REGARDING  

12/28/21 L BEASER  4.60 2,875.00ANALYZE DOCUMENTATION AND INDIVIDUALS 

; 

MULTIPLE CALLS WITH R. LEFF; DISCUSSION WITH 

R. LEFF REGARDING ; REVIEW 

AND ANALYZE  

; DISCUSSION WITH J. POLUKA REGARDING 

; CONFER WITH S. 

VENTRESCA REGARDING

 

; DISCUSSION WITH R. LEFF 

AND J. POLUKA REGARDING ; 

REVIEW DOCUMENTS RECEIVED  

; ADDITIONAL DISCUSSION WITH POLUKA 

AND THEN DISCUSSION WITH R. LEFF AND 

POLUKA REGARDING  

; COMMUNICATIONS AND CONFERENCE 

WITH E. RATLIFF AND POLUKA; ADDITIONAL 

COMMUNICATIONS WITH LEFF AND POLUKA 
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INVOICE NO. 2020070

KENNETT TOWNSHIP

FILE NUMBER: 157103-00602

DATE TIMEKEEPERDESCRIPTION HOURS AMOUNT

12/30/21 J POLUKA  0.90 562.50EMAILS WITH G. GAMBLE, ET AL., AND 

DISCUSSION WITH C. FRANCIS, REGARDING  

; DISCUSSION WITH W. 

HOFFMAN REGARDING  

; EMAILS REGARDING J  

12/30/21 L BEASER  1.30 812.50REVIEW COMMUNICATIONS FROM CLIENT; 

COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. POLUKA REGARDING 

; REVIEW DOCUMENTS  

 

12/31/21 J POLUKA  0.20 125.00UPDATE L. BEASER  

 

12/31/21 L BEASER  0.70 437.50DISCUSSION WITH J. POLUKA REGARDING 

; ANALYZE 

DOCUMENTS  

; ANALYZE DOCUMENTS AND ISSUES 

 38,220.00 TOTAL SERVICES $

CURRENT INVOICE TOTAL  38,220.00 $

TIME AND FEE SUMMARY

HOURSRATETIMEKEEPER FEES

 625.00  25.70  16,062.50 JOSEPH G. POLUKA

 625.00  34.50  21,562.50 LAWRENCE J. BEASER

 425.00  1.40  595.00 SAMUEL M. VENTRESCA

 38,220.00  61.60TOTALS $
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ONE LOGAN SQUARE

PHILADELPHIA, PA  19103-6998

(215)569-5500 FAX: (215) 569-5555

FEDERAL TAX I.D. NO. 23-1311874

KENNETT TOWNSHIP

801 BURROWS RUN ROAD

CHADDS FORD, PA  19317

INVOICE DATE:

CLIENT ID:

MATTER NO.

INVOICE NO.

FEBRUARY 28, 2022

157103

157103-00602 02455

2026099

REGARDING: KENNETT TOWNSHIP

STATE ETHICS COMMISSION MATTER 

FOR LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED THROUGH JANUARY 31, 2022

DATE TIMEKEEPERDESCRIPTION HOURS AMOUNT

01/02/22 J POLUKA  0.20 125.00EMAILS WITH C. FRANCIS AND L. BEASER 

REGARDING ; EMAILS WITH 

BEASER REGARDING  

01/02/22 L BEASER  0.30 187.50REVIEW COMMUNICATION FROM C. FRANCIS  

; REVIEW MATERIAL  

; 

COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. POLUKA 

01/03/22 J POLUKA  0.20 125.00EMAILS WITH R. LEFF REGARDING  

; EMAILS WITH L. BEASER REGARDING 

 

01/03/22 L BEASER  0.50 312.50REVIEW  

 

; REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING 

SAME; COMMUNICATIONS WITH J. POLUKA 

01/03/22 S VENTRESCA  0.20 85.00REVIEW AND ANALYZE  

 

 

01/04/22 J POLUKA  0.50 312.50DISCUSSION WITH L. BEASER REGARDING PLAN 

 

01/04/22  ANALYZE DOCUMENTS AND ISSUES  

; TELEPHONE CONFERENCE 

WITH J. POLUKA REGARDING  

; CONTINUE REVIEW OF 

DOCUMENTS 
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FEBRUARY 28, 2022 

INVOICE NO. 2026099

KENNETT TOWNSHIP

FILE NUMBER: 157103-00602

DATE TIMEKEEPERDESCRIPTION HOURS AMOUNT

01/05/22 J POLUKA  0.80 500.00REVIEW ALL CORRESPONDENCE  

; EMAILS 

WITH R. LEFF AND L. BEASER REGARDING 

 

01/05/22 L BEASER  0.40 250.00REVIEW COMMUNICATIONS  

 

 ADDITIONAL REVIEW OF 

DOCUMENTS  

01/06/22 J POLUKA  0.60 375.00CONFERENCE WITH L. BEASER AND S. VENTRESCA 

REGARDING  

; FOLLOW-UP EMAILS 

WITH R. LEFF AND BEASER 

01/06/22 L BEASER  2.80 1,750.00REVIEW DOCUMENTS  

 

; 

REVIEW EMAILS AND ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS; 

ANALYZE ISSUES ; 

ADDITIONAL REVIEW OF DOCUMENT; PREPARE 

FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN TELEPHONE 

CONFERENCE WITH J. POLUKA; TELEPHONE 

CONFERENCE WITH POLUKA AND S. VENTRESCA; 

ADDITIONAL ANALYSIS OF  

; ADDITIONAL TELEPHONE 

CONFERENCE WITH VENTRESCA REGARDING 

 

01/06/22 S VENTRESCA  0.50 212.50CONFER WITH J. POLUKA AND L. BEASER 

REGARDING  

 

; FOLLOW-UP DISCUSSION 

WITH L. BEASER REGARDING SAME 

01/07/22 J POLUKA  0.50 312.50CONFERENCE WITH R. LEFF AND L. BEASER 

REGARDING  

01/07/22 L BEASER  1.40 875.00REVIEW ; VIDEO 

CONFERENCE WITH R. LEFF AND J. POLUKA 

REGARDING ; FOLLOW-UP  

; PREPARE MEMORANDUM TO J. 

POLUKA AND S. VENTRESCA REGARDING 

 

01/10/22 J POLUKA  0.60 375.00TELEPHONE CALL WITH . 

 

ND FOLLOW-UP EMAILS WITH E. 

RATLIFF, L. BEASER, AND VENTRESCA 
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INVOICE NO. 2026099

KENNETT TOWNSHIP

FILE NUMBER: 157103-00602

DATE TIMEKEEPERDESCRIPTION HOURS AMOUNT

01/10/22 S VENTRESCA  4.10 1,742.50REVIEW AND ANALYZE  

 

 INTRODUCTORY TELEPHONE CALL 

WITH J. POLUKA AND P. DOEHRING  

; EXCHANGE EMAILS WITH E. RATLIFF 

REGARDING  

 

; REVIEW AND COMPILE KEY 

DOCUMENTS REGARDING  

 

 

 

 

 

01/12/22 L BEASER  1.40 875.00BEGIN REVIEW  

; PREPARE ISSUES AND 

QUESTIONS TO RAISE IN INTERVIEWS 

01/13/22 J POLUKA  1.40 875.00CONFERENCE WITH L. BEASER AND S. VENTRESCA, 

 

; EMAILS 

WITH R. LEFF, ET AL., REGARDING  

 

01/13/22 L BEASER  3.10 1,937.50ANALYZE  

; REVIEW  

 

 ANALYZE  

 

; CONFERENCE WITH J. POLUKA AND 

S. VENTRESCA  

 

 

01/13/22 S VENTRESCA  3.10 1,317.50REVIEW AND ANALYZE  

 

 

 

 

 

; CONFERENCE WITH J. POLUKA AND L. 

BEASER REGARDING  
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KENNETT TOWNSHIP

FILE NUMBER: 157103-00602

DATE TIMEKEEPERDESCRIPTION HOURS AMOUNT

01/14/22 J POLUKA  2.20 1,375.00; 

 

01/14/22 L BEASER  0.80 500.00ANALYZE  

; ANALYZE 

 

01/14/22 S VENTRESCA  3.20 1,360.00DRAFT  

 

 UPDATE  

 

 TELEPHONE CALL WITH 

J. MCCARTHY (CHIEF OF LONGWOOD FIRE 

COMPANY) AND J. POLUKA  

01/15/22 J POLUKA  0.20 125.00EMAILS WITH TEAM REGARDING  

 

01/18/22 J POLUKA  2.10 1,312.50WITH S. VENTRESCA,  

; REVIEW  

 

01/18/22 L BEASER  0.40 250.00TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. VENTRESCA 

REGARDING ; REVIEW 

COMMUNICATIONS AND NOTES REGARDING 

 

01/18/22 S VENTRESCA  3.70 1,572.50DRAFT  

; INTERVIEW  

; UPDATE  

 

; DRAFT  

 

 

 

01/19/22 J POLUKA  0.90 562.50REVIEW  

; WITH 

VENTRESCA, CALLS WITH M. GUTTMAN AND J

 

, REGARDING ; RELATED 

EMAILS 

01/19/22 L BEASER  0.40 250.00REVIEW  
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INVOICE NO. 2026099

KENNETT TOWNSHIP

FILE NUMBER: 157103-00602

DATE TIMEKEEPERDESCRIPTION HOURS AMOUNT

01/19/22 S VENTRESCA  0.90 382.50CONFER WITH J. POLUKA REGARDING 

 

 

; 

CIRCULATE ZOOM MEETING INVITATIONS  

 

01/20/22 J POLUKA  2.80 1,750.00WITH S. VENTRESCA, INTERVIEWS OF M. 

GUTTMAN AND J. YETTER 

01/20/22 S VENTRESCA  3.90 1,657.50DRAFT  

; INTERVIEW  

 UPDATE  

 

 DRAFT  

; INTERVIEW  

; UPDATE  

 

01/21/22 J POLUKA  0.50 312.50DISCUSSION WITH S. VENTRESCA, AND EMAILS, 

REGARDING  

01/21/22 S VENTRESCA  0.70 297.50DISCUSSION WITH J. POLUKA REGARDING 

; DRAFT  

 

; EXCHANGE 

EMAILS  

 

01/24/22 J POLUKA  2.70 1,687.50EMAIL FROM P. DOEHRING REGARDING 

; WITH S. 

VENTRESCA, INTERVIEW ; FOLLOW-UP 

DISCUSSION WITH VENTRESCA REGARDING 

; EMAILS WITH 

R. FRANKS AND VENTRESCA; CONFERENCE WITH 

L. BEASER AND VENTRESCA REGARDING  

; CONFERENCE WITH R. 

LEFF, BEASER, AND VENTRESCA  

; EMAILS REGARDING  
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KENNETT TOWNSHIP

FILE NUMBER: 157103-00602

DATE TIMEKEEPERDESCRIPTION HOURS AMOUNT

01/24/22 L BEASER  1.90 1,187.50REVIEW COMMUNICATIONS  

; TELEPHONE 

CONFERENCE WITH J. POLUKA AND S. VENTRESCA 

REGARDING  

 REVIEW  

 

;  

01/24/22 S VENTRESCA  2.70 1,147.50DRAFT  

; INTERVIEW A; 

STRATEGIZE  

REGARDING  

 

; CONFERENCE WITH R. 

LEFF, POLUKA, AND BEASER REGARDING  

; REVISE  

 

; DRAFT 

 

 

01/25/22 J POLUKA  1.80 1,125.00WITH S. VENTRESCA, ; 

FOLLOW-UP DISCUSSION WITH VENTRESCA; 

EMAILS WITH L. BEASER AND VENTRESCA 

REGARDING  

; REVIEW ; EMAILS WITH 

R. LEFF AND TEAM REGARDING  

01/25/22 L BEASER  0.70 437.50REVIEW  AND INTERVIEW 

 

01/25/22 S VENTRESCA  2.60 1,105.00DRAFT . 

 

INTERVIEW  

; REVIEW  

AND SEND SAME TO L. BEASER AND 

POLUKA; REVIEW  

 

 DRAFT EMAIL RESPONSE  

 

 DRAFT EMAIL  

 REVIEW  
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DATE TIMEKEEPERDESCRIPTION HOURS AMOUNT

01/27/22 S VENTRESCA  0.60 255.00SCHEDULE INTERVIEWS  

; CONFERENCE  

EGARDING  

01/28/22 J POLUKA  3.10 1,937.50WITH S. VENTRESCA,  

;  

 

DISCUSSIONS WITH L. BEASER REGARDING  

AND EMAILS WITH D. SANDER AND 

BEASER REGARDING SAME; EMAILS WITH R. LEFF 

REGARDING  

01/28/22 L BEASER  0.30 187.50CONFER WITH J. POLUKA REGARDING  

; REVIEW  

 

; PREPARE COMMUNICATION AND SEND 

 

01/28/22 S VENTRESCA  2.50 1,062.50DRAFT  

); 

DRAFT  

); INTERVIEW  

01/30/22 J POLUKA  0.10 62.50EMAIL  

01/31/22 J POLUKA  2.30 1,437.50WITH S. VENTRESCA, INTERVIEW OF  

FOLLOW-UP DISCUSSION WITH VENTRESCA; 

DISCUSSION WITH R. LEFF AND VENTRESCA, AND 

EMAILS, REGARDING

01/31/22 S VENTRESCA  1.70 722.50INTERVIEW  

 CONFERENCE 

WITH R. LEFF AND J. POLUKA REGARDING  

 

; REVIEW AND EDIT  

 

 

 42,460.00 TOTAL SERVICES $
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CURRENT INVOICE TOTAL  42,460.00 $

TIME AND FEE SUMMARY

HOURSRATETIMEKEEPER FEES

 625.00  27.40  17,125.00 JOSEPH G. POLUKA

 625.00  18.30  11,437.50 LAWRENCE J. BEASER

 425.00  32.70  13,897.50 SAMUEL M. VENTRESCA

 42,460.00  78.40TOTALS $
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